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WEBSITE DISCLAIMER 

Effective Date:  14 July 2025 

 

Atlantic Eye Research Foundation ("we", "our", or "us") provides this website for 
informational and educational purposes. By accessing or using our site, you agree to the 
terms of this disclaimer. If you do not agree, please do not use our website. 

1. Medical Information Disclaimer 

The content on this website is intended for general informational and educational 
purposes only. While we strive to provide accurate and up-to-date information related 
to eye health and medical research, this website does not offer medical advice, 
diagnosis, or treatment. 

You should not rely on the information on this site as a substitute for professional 
medical advice. Always consult with a qualified healthcare provider regarding any 
medical concerns or conditions. 

2. No Doctor-Patient Relationship 

Use of this website or communication via email or contact forms does not establish a 
doctor-patient relationship. The Atlantic Eye Research Foundation does not provide 
individual medical consultations or treatment through this site. 

3. Research and Educational Content 

Our content may reference ongoing or completed medical research. While we aim to 
present reliable data, research findings may evolve, and we do not guarantee that all 
information is current or applicable in every situation. 

4. Donations and Data Collection 

We may collect personal information, such as name, email address, and payment 
details, when you choose to make a donation. All data is collected and processed in 
accordance with our Privacy Policy. We use secure methods to process donations, but 
we are not responsible for breaches or errors caused by third-party processors. 
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5. External Links 

Our website may contain links to third-party websites for informational or reference 
purposes. These links do not imply endorsement, and we are not responsible for the 
content, accuracy, or privacy practices of external sites. 

6. No Warranties 

We make no warranties or representations about the accuracy, reliability, or 
completeness of the content on this website. All materials are provided “as is” without 
warranties of any kind, either express or implied. 

7. Limitation of Liability 

To the fullest extent permitted by law, Atlantic Eye Research Foundation and its 
affiliates, staff, or contributors will not be liable for any direct, indirect, incidental, or 
consequential damages arising out of your use of, or inability to use, this website or the 
information it contains. 

8. Audience Notice 

This website is intended for both medical professionals and members of the general 
public. Medical professionals should not substitute our content for clinical judgment, 
and laypersons should always seek advice from licensed professionals before making 
decisions related to health. 

9. Changes to This Disclaimer 

We may update this disclaimer from time to time. Continued use of the site after any 
such changes constitutes your acceptance of the new terms. 

 

 


